
PUBLIC NOTICE OF RECOMMENDED AWARD
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

SPECIFICATION NO. #PD 10‐11.059

Terminal: Marathon Ent.

             BID TABULATION
Bid Opening Time:  3:00 p.m,.CDT Cougar Oil Inc.
Bid Opening Date: 07/07/2011 Pensacola Mobile Atmore Montgomery Niceville Freeport

Bid Opening Location: Rm 11.407
DESCRIPTION Markup to Supplier's List

TRANSPORT DELIVERY

Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.03267 0.0519 N/A 0.1039 0.0569 0.0688
Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.03267 0.0519 N/A 0.1039 0.0569 0.0688
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.0339 0.0569 0.0626 0.1159 0.0619 0.0759
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.0339 0.0569 0.0626 0.1159 0.0619 0.0759
Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.03267 0.0519 N/A 0.1039 0.0569 0.0688

TANK WAGON DELIVERY

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.15767 0.1769 N/A 0.2289 0.1819 0.1938
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.15767 0.1769 N/A 0.2289 0.1819 0.1938

Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.1589 0.1819 N/A 0.2409 0.1869 0.2009
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.1589 0.1819 0.1876 0.2409 0.1869 0.2009
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.15767 0.1769 0.1876 0.2289 0.1819 0.1938

TERMINALS & AVAILABLE SUPPLIERS
Terminal:  Pensacola, Transmontaigne Suppliers: BP Branded, Flint Hills, Motiva Ent., Truman Arnold, Pure TPSI
Terminal: BP Mobile Suppliers: BP Branded, BP Unbranded, Truman Arnold
Terminal: Shell Refinery Mobile Suppliers: Murphy, BP Branded, Motiva Ent.
Terminal: Citgo- Niceville Suppliers: BP Branded, Citgo Unbranded, Truman Arnold

Terminal: Murphy Montgomery Suppliers: Pure, TPSI, Murphy
Terminal: Marathon Montgomery  Montgomery Suppliers: Marathon, Motiva Ent.Suppliers: Marathon, Motiva 

DESCRIPTION
TRANSPORT DELIVERY Mansfield Oil Company

Pensacola Mobile Atmore Montgomery Niceville Freeport

Markup to Supplier's List
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.0353 0.0535 0.0546 0.1053 0.0546 0.0581
Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.0353 0.0535 0.0546 0.1053 0.0546 0.0581
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.0377 0.0587 0.0599 0.1077 0.0599 0.0634

#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 0.0377 0.0587 0.0599 0.1077 0.0599 0.0634

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.0353 0.0535 0.0549 0.1053 0.0546 0.0581
TANK WAGON DELIVERY

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.2455 0.2580 0.2780 0.3155 0.2730 0.2780
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.2455 0.2580 0.2780 0.3155 0.2730 0.2780

Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.2455 0.2580 0.2780 0.3155 0.2730 0.2780
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.2005 0.2130 0.2330 0.2705 0.2280 0.2330
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.2005 0.2130 0.2330 0.2705 0.2280 0.2330

TERMINALS & AVAILABLE SUPPLIERS

Terminal: TransMontaigne (Pensacola, FL) Suppliers:  BP, Flint Hills, Motiva, Murphy, TransMontaigne
Terminal: BP, Chervron (Mobile, AL) Suppliers: BP, Exxon Mobile, Shell, Citgo, Motiva
Terminal: BP, Marathon, Magellan, etc. Suppliers: BP, Chevron, Exxon Mobil, Flint Hills, Motiva, TransMontaigne, Marathon
Terminal: CITGO (Niceville, FL) Suppliers: Chevron, ConocoPhillips, Exxon Mobil, Citgo
Terminal: Murphy (Freeport, FL) Suppliers:  Murphy



PUBLIC NOTICE OF RECOMMENDED AWARD
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

SPECIFICATION NO. #PD 10‐11.059

DESCRIPTION
TRANSPORT DELIVERY The McPherson Companies, Inc.

Pensacola Mobile Atmore Montgomery Niceville Freeport

Markup to Supplier's List

Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.0319 0.0539 N/A 0.189 0.129 0.149
Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.0319 0.0539 N/A 0.189 0.129 0.149
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.0329 0.0579 N/A 0.199 0.139 0.159

#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 0.0329 0.0579 N/A 0.199 0.139 0.159

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.0319 0.0539 N/A 0.189 0.129 0.149

TANK WAGON DELIVERY

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.1485 0.1990 N/A 0.499 0.329 0.329
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.1485 0.1990 N/A 0.499 0.329 0.329

Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.1485 0.1990 N/A 0.499 0.329 0.329
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.1485 0.1990 N/A 0.499 0.329 0.329
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.1485 0.1990 N/A 0.499 0.329 0.329

TERMINALS & AVAILABLE 
SUPPLIERS

Terminal: TPSI- Pensacola Suppliers:  BP, Citgo, Fint Hills, Motiva, Shell, TPSI
Terminal: Shell Chemical-Saraland, AL Suppliers: BP, Citgo, Exxon/Mobil, Motica, Mystik, Shell
Terminal: CITGO (Niceville, FL) Suppliers: Citgo, Shell
Terminal: Murphy-Freeport, FL Suppliers: Murphy
Terminal: Montgomery, AL-Various Suppliers: BP, Citgo, Colonial, Exxon, Flint Hills, Marathon Motiva, Murphy, 

Placid, Shell

DESCRIPTION
TRANSPORT DELIVERY Petroleum Traders Corporation

Pensacola Mobile Atmore Montgomery Niceville Freeport

Markup to Supplier's List
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.0543 0.0501 No Bid 0.0565 0.0687 0.0779
Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.0543 0.0501 No Bid 0.0565 0.0687 0.0779
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.0568 0.052 No Bid 0.0957 0.0886 0.0840

#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 0.0568 0.052 No Bid 0.0957 0.0886 0.0840

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.0543 0.0501 No Bid 0.0565 0.0687 0.0779
TANK WAGON DELIVERY

Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.2300 0.2700 No Bid 0.3000 0.2700 0.2700
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.2300 0.2700 No Bid 0.3000 0.2700 0.2700

Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.2300 0.2700 No Bid 0.3000 0.2700 0.2700
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.2300 0.2700 No Bid 0.3000 0.2700 0.2700
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.2300 0.2700 No Bid 0.3000 0.2700 0.2700

TERMINALS & AVAILABLE 
SUPPLIERS

Terminal:  Pensacola, FL Suppliers: Flint Hills, Motiva, Murphy & Transmontaigne
Terminal: Mobile, AL Suppliers: BP, ExxonMobil, Chevron, Flint Hills, Motiva, Murphy, Placid and Valero

Terminal: Atmore, AL Suppliers: N/A
Terminal: Montgomery, AL Suppliers: Colonial, Marathon, Placid, Mruphy and Motiva
Terminal: Niceville, FL Supplier: Citgo
Terminal: Freeport & Panama City, FL Supplier: Murphy, Valero, Flint Hills and Citgo



PUBLIC NOTICE OF RECOMMENDED AWARD
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

SPECIFICATION NO. #PD 10‐11.059

PD 10 11 059 li d Diese Oil

DESCRIPTION
TRANSPORT DELIVERY RKA Petroleum Companies, Inc.

Pensacola Mobile Atmore Montgomery Niceville Freeport

Markup to Supplier's List
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.0506 0.0700 No Bid 0.1133 0.0713 0.0827
Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.0506 0.07 No Bid 0.1133 0.0713 0.0827
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.0592 0.0852 No Bid 0.1429 0.0869 0.0963
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 0.0592 0.0852 No Bid 0.1429 0.0869 0.0963
Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.0506 0.07 No Bid 0.1133 0.0713 0.0827

TANK WAGON DELIVERY
Gasoline, Unleaded, 87 Octane 0.1870 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2570 0.2764
Gasoline, Unleaded, 89 Octane 0.1870 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0257 0.2764

Gasoline, Unleaded, 92 Octane 0.1870 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0257 0.2764
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel, Red Dye 0.1870 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0257 0.2764
#2-D Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Fuel 0.1870 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0257 0.2764

TERMINALS & AVAILABLE SUPPLIERS

Terminal:  Pensacola, FL Suppliers: TransMontaigne, Motiva and Flint Hills
Terminal: Mobile, AL Suppliers: Motiva and Citgo

Terminal: Atmore, AL Suppliers: N/A
Terminal: Montgomery, AL Suppliers: Marathon, Murphy, Chevron, Colonial and Musket
Terminal: Niceville, FL Supplier: Citgo and Murphy
Terminal: Freeport & Panama City, FL Supplier: Murphy

The Escambia Road Department recommends to the BCC to award an Indefinite Quantity, Indefinite Delivery Contract 
for PD 10 11 059 "Gasoline and Diesel Fuel" to: Cougar Oil Incfor  - .  "Gaso ne an  l Fuel" to: Cougar  Inc.
Pursuant to Section 119.07(3)(M),F.S., all documents relating to this tabulation are available for public inspection
copying at the Office of the Purchasing Manager.

Posted: 10:00 a.m, CDT, Monday, July 18, 2011                                                                                              JFP/ crs
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